

	PD-14-043 Bid Opening 8/21/14 Supply and Delivery of Janitorial Supplies		VENDOR Calico Industries, Inc. 9045 Junction Drive Annapolis Junction, MD 20701 Mr. Michael Heverly 800-638-0828 Phone 301-575-0131 Fax	VENDOR Camden Bag & Paper Co. 114 Gaither Drive Mt. Laurel, NJ 08054 Mr. Fred Rasmussen 856-727-3313 Phone 856-727-4114 Fax	VENDOR Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC 255 Rutes 1 & 9 Jersey City, NJ 03102 Mr. Paul Cervino 201-437-7440 Phone 201-437-7442 Fax	VENDOR Office Basics, Inc. 22 Creek Circle Boothwyn, PA 19061 Ms. Katherine Leighton 800-541-5855 Phone 800-225-4049 Fax				
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
1	DRACKETT, WHISTLE ALL PURPOSE CLEANER, BOTTLES MUST HAVE SPRAY TRIGGER, 32 OZ, 12/CASE	5 CASES	NO BID		\$19.54 BRAND: MAVERICK	\$97.70	\$51.83 BRAND: DRACKETT	\$259.15	\$25.00 BRAND: BOARDWALK	\$125.00
2	AUSTINS A-1 BLEACH, 1 GALLON, 6/CASE	40 CASES	NO BID		\$10.20 BRAND: AUSTIN	\$408.00	\$9.06 BRAND: AUSTIN	\$362.48	\$9.35 BRAND: AUSTINS	\$374.00
3	BAB-O POWDERED CLEANSER, 21OZ, 30/CASE	10 CASES	NO BID		\$17.88 BRAND: BABO	\$178.80	\$15.92 BRAND: R3	\$159.20	\$17.65 BRAND: BABO	\$176.50
4	PINE SCENTED CLEANER/DEODORIZER, 1 GAL, 4/CASE	60 CASES	NO BID		\$15.44 BRAND: JEWEL	\$926.40	\$14.99 BRAND: EPIC	\$899.40	\$16.65 BRAND; BOARDWALK	\$999.00
5	5 WHEEL DOLLY FOR 44 GALLON RUBBERMAID TRASH CAN, #2643-G	12 EACH	\$22.94 BRAND: CONTINENTAL 3255	\$275.28	\$23.88 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$286.56	\$20.62 BRAND: RUBBERMAID	\$247.44	\$43.75 BRAND: RUBBERMAID	\$525.00
6	STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER, 18 OZ, 12/CASE	20 CASES	NO BID		\$25.70 BRAND: CHASE	\$514.00	\$49.96 BRAND: CHAMPION	\$999.36	\$29.90 BRAND: BOARDWALK	\$598.00
7	BOWL CLEANER, LIQUID CONCENTRATE, 1 QT, 12/CASE	150 CASES	NO BID		\$15.80 BRAND: STARCO	\$2,370.00	\$15.55 BRAND: CAREFREE	\$2,332.50	\$16.50 BRAND: DORCHESTER MIDLAND	\$2,475.00
8	BROOMS, STRAW	52 EACH	\$4.44 BRAND: GREENWOOD 561	\$230.88	\$4.29 BRAND: N/A	\$223.08	\$3.30 BRAND: JANICO	\$171.60	\$6.45 BRAND: OCEP6122	\$335.40
9	CHEWING GUM/CANDLE WAS REMOVER	10 CASES	NO BID		\$22.52 BRAND: CHASE	\$225.20	\$23.01 BRAND: CLAIRE	\$230.10	\$29.40 BRAND: ELITE	\$294.00
10	DRAIN OPENER, 1 QT, 12/CASE	20 CASES	NO BID		\$28.40 STARCO HOME RUN	\$568.00	\$26.92 BRAND: STARCO	\$538.40	\$21.50 BRAND: SIMONIZE	\$430.00

Bid Opening 8/21/14			Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
11	STANDARD LATEX RUBBER GLOVES, 12 PAIRS/BAG, MED	12 BAGS	\$4.98 BRAND: CALICO 2962MD	\$59.76	\$5.40 BRAND: N/A	\$64.80	\$9.48 BRAND: SAFETY ZONE	\$113.76	\$9.75 BRAND: BOARDWALK	\$117.00
12	STANDARD LATEX RUBBER GLOVES, 12 PAIRS/BAG, LG.	12 BAGS	\$4.98 BRAND: CALICO 2962LD	\$39.84	\$5.40 BRAND: N/A	\$64.80	\$9.48 BRAND: SAFETY ZONE	\$113.76	\$9.75 BRAND: BOARDWALK	\$117.00
13	WET MOP HEADS, 12 OZ.	175 EACH	\$1.64 BRAND: ABCO CM20012	\$287.00	\$2.04 BRAND: SCOTTY	\$357.00	\$1.01 BRAND: WILEN-NORSHELL	\$176.75	NO BID	
14	WET MOP HEADS, 24OZ	175 EACH	\$2.48 BRAND: GREENWOOD 305NBW	\$66.96	\$2.98 BRAND: SCOTTY	\$521.50	\$1.88 BRAND: WILEN-NORSHELL	\$329	\$2.50 BRAND: ADVANTAGE	\$437.50
15	WET MOP HEADS, 16 OZ.	100 EACH	\$2.18 BRAND: GREENWOOD 303	\$218.00	\$2.39 BRAND: SCOTTY	\$239.00	\$1.24 BRAND: WILEN-NORSHELL	\$124.00	NO BID	
16	WET MOP HEADS, 16 OZ., RAYON ONLY	50 EACH	\$2.74 BRAND: GREENWOOD 3104	\$137.00	\$3.19 BRAND: PEARL	\$159.50	\$2.58 BRAND: JANICO	\$129.00	NO BID	
17	JOHNNI MOPS, SOFT TOILET BRUSHES, 100/CASE	3 CASES	\$50.54 BRAND: TOLCO 280100	\$151.62	\$69.00 BRAND: N/A	\$207.00	\$64.80 BRAND: JANICO	\$194.40	\$51.85 BRAND: IMPACT	\$155.55
18	SIGNS, "CAUTION, WET FLOOR" YELLOW PLASTIC	12 EACH	\$5.94 BRAND: WINCO WC525	\$71.28	\$7.20 BRAND: N/A	\$86.40	\$7.65 BRAND: JANICO 6109RM	\$91.80	\$7.65 BRAND: UNISAN	\$91.80
19	PLASTIC WET MOP BUCKET W/WHEELS AND WRINGER YELLOW, 35 QT. CAPACITY	12 EACH	\$40.44 BRAND: ABCO TO1007	\$485.28	\$45.70 BRAND: JANICO	\$548.40	\$33.59 BRAND: CONTICO	\$403.08	\$43.75 BRAND: CARLISLE	\$525.00
20	WATERLESS HAND CLEANER, 6 OZ, 24/CASE	10 CASES	NO BID		\$56.15 BRAND: MONK MECHANICS	\$561.50	\$42.99 BRAND: GOLD	\$429.90	NO BID	
21	CLARIO TF FOAMING, WHITE, TOUCH FREE DISPENSER #91866-00, NO SUBS	24 EACH NO SUBS	NO BID		\$27.40 BRAND: CLARIO	\$657.60	\$28.37 BRAND: BETCO	\$680.88	NO BID	
22	LIQUID HAND SOAP, 1 GAL, 4/CASE	40 CASES	NO BID		\$17.20 BRAND: JEWEL	\$688.00	\$16.16 BRAND: BULLEN	\$646.40	\$17.50 BRAND: PROFESSIONAL CHOICE	\$700.00

Bid Opening 8/21/14			Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
23	CLARIO ULTRABLUe ANTI-BACTERIAL FOAMING SKIN CLEANSER FOR CLARIO TF DISPENSER, #75929-00	40 CASES NO SUBS	NO BID		\$54.85 BRAND: CLARIO	\$2,194.00	\$46.41 BRAND: BETCO	\$1,456.40	NO BID	
24	WASP & HORNET SPRAY, 12 OZ., 12/CASE	8 CASES	NO BID		\$37.98 BRAND: CHASE (15OZ, 12/CASE)	\$303.84	\$40.39 BRAND: BLACK FLAG	\$323.12	\$45.90 BRAND: CLAIRE	\$367.20
25	DUST BRUCH, 8 INCH	24 EACH	\$2.24 BRAND: ABCO 00100	\$53.76	\$2.96 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$71.04	\$2.76 BRAND: NORSELL	\$66.24	\$4.75 BRAND: CARLISLE	\$114.00
26	FRANKLIN'S "OFFENSE" FLOOR STRIPPER, NON-AMMONIATED, NON RINSE, 5 GALLON CONTAINER	40 CONT.	NO BID		\$31.88 BRAND: JEWEL MOP STRIP PLUS	\$1,275.20	\$39.26 BRAND: BULLEN	\$1,570.40	\$42.50 BRAND: SIMONIZE	\$1,700.00
27	3M STANCE FLOOR FINISH, 2.5 GAL, 2/CASE	50 CASES	NO BID		\$60.80 BRAND: JEWEL EXTENDED	\$3,040.00	\$45.50 BRAND: BULLEN	\$2,275.00	NO BID	
28	3M CARPET PROTECTOR, 1 GALLON	10 GAL	NO BID		\$47.15 BRAND: BETCO	\$471.50	\$99.00 BRAND: 3M	\$990.00	NO BID	
29	3M SOPT REMOVER, 12 OZ, 12/CASE	8 CASES	NO BID		\$31.70 BRAND: BETCO	\$253.60	\$29.50 BRAND: BULLEN (32OZ.)	\$441.32	NO BID	
30	POWDERED CARPET DEODORANT, 14 OZ, 12/CASE	20 CASES	NO BID		\$23.63 BRAND: CARPET FRESH	\$472.60	\$27.50 BRAND: FRANKLIN	\$550.00	\$25.90 BRAND: SHAKE DOWN	\$518.00
31	HEAVY DUTY DRAIN ACID, LIQUID, 1 QT, 12/CASE	20 CASES	NO BID		\$28.40 BRAND: STARCO	\$568.00	\$29.00 BRAND: BETCO	\$58.00	\$21.50 BRAND: SIMONIZ	\$430.00
32	3M TROUBLE SHOOTER CLEANER 12 OZ., 12/CASE	20 CASES NO SUBS	NO BID		\$27.80 BRAND: CHASE (19OZ, 12/CASE)	\$556.00	\$95.59 BRAND: 3M	\$1,911.80	\$127.30 BRAND: 3M	\$2,546.00
33	3M SPRAY BUFF CLEANER & POLISH, 1 GAL, 4/CASE	10 CASES	NO BID		\$22.60 BRAND: STARCO	\$226.00	\$28.20 BRAND: AMERICAN CLEANING	\$282.00	NO BID	
34	SPIC & SPAN CONCENTRATED POWDER CLEANER 27 OZ, 12/CASE	20 CASES NO SUBS	NO BID		\$99.88 BRAND: NO SUBS	\$1,997.60	\$88.23 BRAND: NO SUBS	\$1,764.60	\$82.70 BRAND: NO SUBS	\$1,654.00

Bid Opening 8/21/14			Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
35	JOHNSON'S LEMON SHINE-UP FURNITURE WAX 150Z, 12/CASE	10 CASES	NO BID		\$25.88 BRAND: CHASE (170Z, 12/CASE)	\$258.80	\$30.48 BRAND: CLAIRE	\$304.80	\$52.95 BRAND: JOHNSONS	\$529.50
36	NOXON METAL POLISH #7, 12 OZ, 6/CASE	3 CASES	NO BID		NO BID		\$36.00 BRAND: NOXON (12CASE)	\$108.00	\$34.95 BRAND: RECKITT	\$104.85
37	RUG SHAMPOO, 1 GAL, 6/CASE	10 CASES	NO BID		\$41.60 BRAND: BETCO (4/CASE)	\$416.00	\$30.00 BRAND: BULLEN (4 CASE)	\$300.00	\$53.50 BRAND: MISCO	\$535.00
38	ENVIROX CONCENTRATE #118 4/1 GAL CASES	40 CASES NO SUBS	NO BID		\$158.00 BRAND: NO SUBS	\$6,320.00	NO BID		NO BID	
39	ENVIROX CONCENTRATE #117 4/1 GAL CASES #ENV-117-04B	40 CASES NO SUBS	NO BID		\$158.00 BRAND: NO SUBS	\$6,320.00	NO BID		NO BID	
40	FAST ORANGE HAND CLEANER, 7.5 OZ BOTTLES #25108 12 BOTTLES PER CASE	12 CASES	NO BID		NO BID		\$24.00 BRAND: PERMATEX	\$288.00	\$22.95 BRAND: DYMON	\$275.40
41	FEMININE NAPKINS, GARD'S #1474, 250/CASE	5 CASES	NO BID		NO BID		\$25.75 BRAND: N/A	\$128.75	\$32.50 BRAND: ROCHESTER MIDLAND	\$162.50
42	PLAYTEX SUPER TAMPONS, ROUND, 500/CASE	5 CASES	NO BID		NO BID		\$130.24 BRAND: PLAYTEX	\$651.20	\$76.15 BRAND: ROCHESTER MIDLAND	\$380.75
48	INSECT REPELLANT, SKIN, 8 OZ CANS, 6/CASE	5 CASES	NO BID		\$44.88 BRAND: CHASE (60Z CANS, 12/CASE)	\$224.40	\$81.93 BRAND: SC JOHNSON	\$409.65	\$56.35 BRAND: DIVERSEY	\$281.75
49	INSECTICIDE FLY SPRAY, 12 OZ, 12/CASE	5 CASES	NO BID		\$36.46 BRAND: CHASE (18 OZ, 12/CASE)	\$182.30	\$47.05 BRAND: BETCO	\$235.25	\$45.65 BRAND: CLAIRE	\$228.25
49A	BLACK FLAG OR RAID ANT & ROACH SPRAY 14 OZ, 12/CASE	5 CASES	NO BID		\$36.46 BRAND: CHASE (18 OZ, 12/CASE)	\$182.30	\$39.35 BRAND: CLAIRE	\$196.75	\$46.95 BRAND: CLAIRE	\$234.75
50	INSECTICIDE-ORTHO ANT & ROACH WITH HOSE AND SPRAYER 1/2 GALLON BOTTLE	12 BTLS	NO BID		NO BID		\$4.10 BRAND: ASTOR	\$49.20	NO BID	

Bid Opening 8/21/14			Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
51	ANT TRAPS, 6 GRAMS, 3/PKG	15 PKGS	NO BID		NO BID		\$9.30	\$139.50	NO BID	
							BRAND: DIAL			
52	WAX APPLICATORS, LAMBS WOOL W/HANDLE, 10 INCH	20 EACH	NO BID		\$7.04	\$140.80	\$4.17	\$83.40	NO BID	
					BRAND: N/A		BRAND: NORSELL			
53	WAX APPLICATORS, LAMBS WOOL W/HANDLE, 16 INCH	20 EACH	NO BID		\$10.27	\$205.40	\$7.08	\$141.60	NO BID	
					BRAND: N/A		BRAND:			
54	WAX APPLICATOR, REFILL, LAMBS WOOL, 10 INCH	25 EACH	NO BID		\$1.65	\$41.25	\$4.17	\$104.25	NO BID	
					BRAND: N/A		BRAND: NORSELL			
54A	WAX APPLICATOR, REFI, LAMBS WOOL, 16 INCH	25 EACH	NO BID		\$2.88	\$72.00	\$9.35	\$233.75	NO BID	
					BRAND: N/A		BRAND: LAGASSE			
55	VACUUM BAGS CLEAN MAX PRO (CMPS-QD) OR EQUAL 12 PER CASE	20 CASES	NO BID		\$9.54	\$190.80	\$14.89	\$297.80	NO BID	
					BRAND: CLEAN MAX		BRAND: M&M			
56	WASTE BASKETS, RUBBERMAID #2956, 12/CASE	2 CASES	\$40.84	\$81.68	\$50.40	\$100.80	\$72.72	\$145.44	\$63.75	\$127.50
			BRAND: CONTINENTAL 2818		BRAND: OCEDAR		BRAND: RUBBERMAID		BRAND: RUBBERMAID	
57	BROOM-GARAGE, 24 INCH WITH HANDLE	12 EACH	\$10.49	\$125.88	\$8.94	\$107.28	\$6.43	\$77.16	\$11.85	\$142.20
			BRAND: ABCO BH1004		BRAND: OCEDAR		BRAND: CULICOVER		BRAND: CARLISLE	
58	BROOM-FLOOR, 24 INCH WITH HANDLE	12 EACH	\$9.43	\$113.16	\$9.19	\$110.28	\$9.45	\$113.40	\$11.50	\$138.00
			BRAND: ABCO BH12007		BRAND: OCEDAR		BRAND: CULICOVER		BRAND: CARLISLE	
59	SCRUB BRUSH, 8 INCH	24 EACH	\$1.24	\$29.76	\$1.88	\$45.12	\$1.05	\$25.20	NO BID	
			BRAND: ABCO 00027		BRAND: N/A		BRAND: CULICOVER			
60	TOILET SEAT COVER DISPENSER, HALF FOLD RESTASSURED, WHITE , 10 PER CASE OR EQUAL	2 CASES	\$44.94	\$89.88	\$5.99	\$119.80	\$ N/C	\$ N/C	\$63.50	\$127.00
			BRAND: WINCO TSC10		BRAND: N/A		BRAND:		BRAND: IMPACT	
61	TRASH CAN, RUBBERMAID, 44 GAL, #2643-G, WHITE LID #2645-G	12 EACH	\$37.56	\$450.72	\$39.88	\$478.56	\$52.80	\$633.60	\$33.95	\$407.40
			BRAND: CONTINENTAL 4444/4445		BRAND: OCEDAR (WITH LID)		BRAND: RUBBERMAID		BRAND: IMPACT	

Bid Opening 8/21/14			Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
62	VACUUM BAG "MM" FOR EUREKA, #60295C-6 36/CASE OR EQUAL	3 CASES	NO BID		\$25.64 BRAND: N/A	\$76.92	\$114.45 BRAND: M&M	\$343.44	NO BID	
63	SANJAMAR ELECTRONIC TOWEL CABINET (#SAN-T1300TBK), BLACK PEARL OR EQUAL	15 EACH	\$89.54 BRAND: SANJAMAR T1300TBK	\$1,343.10	\$69.80 BRAND: PALMER	\$1,047.00	\$86.62 BRAND: SANJAMAR	\$1,299.90	\$81.90 BRAND: SANJAMAR	\$1,228.50
64	VACUUM BELTS, ROUND, FOR EUREKA UPRIGHT	100 EACH	NO BID		\$0.61 BRAND: N/A	\$61.00	\$0.88 BRAND: M&M	\$88.00	\$1.40 BRAND: EUREKA	\$140.00
65	VACUUM BELTS, ROUND, HOOVER #59258	25 EACH	NO BID		\$0.89 BRAND: N/A	\$22.25	\$0.93 BRAND: M&M	\$23.25	NO BID	
66	EXTENSION HANDLES, 60 INCH FOR BROOMS	75 EACH	NO BID		\$2.92 BRAND: N/A	\$219.00	\$3.50 BRAND: NORSHALL	\$262.50	\$2.45 BRAND: CARLISLE	\$183.75
67	BROOM, STREET, 16 INCH WITH HANDLE	12 EACH	\$9.10 BRAND: ABCO BH13001/01113	\$109.20	\$10.20 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$122.40	\$8.73 BRAND: CULICOVER	\$104.76	\$5.75 BRAND: CARLISLE	\$69.00
68	BRUSHES, TOILET BRISTLE	100 EACH	\$0.98 BRAND: ABCO BH18001	\$98.00	\$0.99 BRAND: HANDY KLENZE	\$99.00	\$1.99 BRAND: CULICOVER	\$199.00	\$2.75 BRAND: BOARDWALK	\$275.00
69	BUCKETS, 10 QT, GALVANIZED	12 EACH	NO BID		\$13.99 BRAND: IMPACT	\$167.88	\$6.98 BRAND: RUBBERMAID	\$83.76	NO BID	
70	VACUUM BAG, ADVANCE SPECTRUM 12P W/2 PRE FILTERS, 10 BAGS PER PKG, OR EQUAL	30 PKG	NO BID		\$14.88 BRAND: N/A	\$446.40	\$14.95 BRAND: M&M	\$448.50	NO BID	
71	3M-6472 INSTA-LOK DOODLEBUG PAD BLOCK	5 EACH	\$3.74 BRAND: TOLCO 280137	\$18.70	\$4.58 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$22.90	\$31.88 BRAND: 3M	\$159.40	NO BID	
72	3M-6473 INSTA-LOK DOODLEBUG HAND BLOCK	5 EACH	\$3.84 BRAND: TOLCO 280139	\$19.20	\$4.58 BRAND: N/A	\$22.90	\$25.00 BRAND: 3M	\$125.00	NO BID	
73	KNEE PADS, RUBBER	2 SETS	NO BID		\$9.85 BRAND: ARBIL	\$19.70	\$11.62 BRAND: BALL	\$23.24	NO BID	

Bid Opening 8/21/14			Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
74	DISPENSERS - LEV-R-MATIC, ROLL TIP #970 ROLL TOWEL	6 EACH	NO BID		\$37.80 BRAND: CASCADE	\$226.80	\$25.00 BRAND: KIMBERLY CLARK	\$150.00	\$32.75 BRAND: PALMER	\$196.50
75	DUSTERS, SWIFFER DUSTER STARTER KIT #PGC 40509, OR EQUAL	50 EACH	NO BID		\$41.88 BRAND: N/A	\$2,094.00	\$13.86 BRAND: LEE	\$693.00	\$3.95 BRAND: PROCTOR & GAMBLE	\$197.50
76	DUSTERS, EXTENSION, 70 INCH	36 EACH	NO BID		\$4.88 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$175.68	\$6.55 BRAND: TXF	\$235.80	\$7.75 BRAND: UNISAN	\$279.00
77	DISPENSER, BLEND BUDDY FOR ENVIROX CONCENTRATE #ENV-8-252-117	12 EACH NO SUBS	NO BID		\$94.00 BRAND: N/A	\$1,128.00	NO BID		NO BID	
78	DISPENSER-FEMININE NAPKIN, J-6, 25 CENT RELEASE	2 EACH	NO BID		NO BID		\$199.00 BRAND: ROCHESTER	\$398.00	NO BID	
79	DISPENSER-TOILET PAPER, SCOTT #969 (ALTERNATE: CASCADE COVERED DUAL ROLL-PLASTIC \$16.00)	30 EACH	NO BID		\$9.99 BRAND: SANJAMAR	\$299.70	\$49.50 BRAND: SCOTT	\$1,485.00	NO BID	
80	NAPKINS-NEW DISPOSABLE UNIT, RUBBERMAID #6140	6 EACH	NO BID		\$19.93 BRAND: IMPACT	\$119.58	\$51.90 BRAND: RUBBERMAID	\$311.40	\$20.95 BRAND: ROCHESTER MIDLAND	\$125.70
81	BAGS, DISPOSABLE SANITARY UNIT, RUBBERMAID #6141 250/BOX	12 BOXES	\$17.54 BRAND: HOSPECO HS-6141	\$210.48	\$19.80 BRAND: SANI SAC (500 BOX)	\$237.60	\$23.97 BRAND: RUBBERMAID	\$287.64	\$18.90 BRAND: ROCHESTER MIDLAND	\$226.80
82	DISPOSABLE TOILET SEAT COVERS, PAPER, 250/PKG, 20 PKGS/CASE	50 CASES	\$26.94 BRAND: CALICO	\$1,347.00	\$29.35 BRAND: HOSPECO	\$1,467.50	\$26.70 BRAND: CAREFREE	\$1,335.00	\$23.50 BRAND: NITANY PAPER	\$1,175.00
83	DUST MOP HEAD FRAME, 36 INCH X 5 INCH	24 EACH	\$2.94 BRAND: ABCO BH24536	\$70.56	\$3.75 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$90.00	\$3.00 BRAND: ABCO	\$72.00	\$3.85 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$92.40
84	MATS, WALKOFF, 3 FT X 5 FT, COLOR: GRAY	12 EACH	NO BID		\$27.80 BRAND: AMERICO	\$333.60	\$34.47 BRAND: PROFORM	\$413.14	\$31.95 BRAND: CROWN	\$383.40
85	MATS, WALKOFF, 4 FT X 6 FT, COLOR: GRAY	12 EACH	NO BID		\$41.40 BRAND: AMERICO	\$496.80	\$55.15 BRAND: PROFORM	\$661.80	\$50.95 BRAND: CROWN	\$611.40

Bid Opening 8/21/14			Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
86	DUSTMOP, 24" X 5", HANDLE & MOPHEAD HOLDER	10 EACH	\$8.80 BRAND: ABCO BH24524/01406NB	\$88.00	\$8.44 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$84.40	\$12.48 BRAND: NORSELL	\$124.80	NO BID	
87	MOP HANDLE, 60 INCH, WING NUT	50 EACH	\$4.74 BRAND: ABCO 01203NB	\$237.00	\$5.90 BRAND: N/A	\$295.00	\$6.99 BRAND: ABCO	\$349.50	\$6.99 BRAND: UNISAN	\$349.50
88	MOP DUST HEADS, 36" X 5"	72 EACH	\$4.54 BRAND: GREENWOOD 618	\$326.88	\$6.45 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$464.40	\$3.30 BRAND: NORSELL	\$237.50	\$4.30 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$309.60
89	MOP DUST HEADS, 24" X 5"	72 EACH	\$3.54 BRAND: GREENWOOD 616	\$254.88	\$4.85 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$349.20	\$3.30 BRAND: NORSELL	\$237.50	\$3.20 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$230.40
90	FLOOR SQUEEGEE, CURVED DUAL EDGE, 18 INCH	6 EACH	NO BID		\$13.68 BRAND: N/A	\$82.08	\$16.20 BRAND: IMPACT	\$97.20	NO BID	
91	MOP, DUST, 18" X 5"	36 EACH	\$2.94 BRAND: GREENWOOD 615	\$105.84	\$4.10 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$147.60	\$2.49 BRAND: JANICO	\$89.64	\$2.75 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$99.00
92	HANDLE & FRAME FOR 18" X 5" DUST MOP	12 EACH	\$6.83 BRAND: ABCO BH25418/0140GNB	\$81.96	\$8.45 BRAND: N/A	\$101.40	\$7.23 BRAND: ABCO	\$86.76	\$7.55 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$90.60
93	OIL DRY, 40 OR 50LB BAGS LBS/BAG: _____	20 BAGS	NO BID		NO BID		\$9.50 BRAND: BRENNER	\$184.00	\$6.85 BRAND: MOTTAN (40LB BAG)	\$137.00
94	PADS, BUFFING/POLISHING, 16 INCH, RED, 5/CASE	10 CASES	\$8.44 BRAND: AMERICO 404416	\$84.40	\$11.70 BRAND: AMERICO	\$117.00	\$9.00 BRAND: ACS	\$90.00	\$8.55 BRAND: ACS	\$85.50
95	PADS, BLACK, SCRUBBING, 16 INCH, THICK LINE, 5/CASE	5 CASES	\$8.64 BRAND: AMERICO 400116	\$43.20	\$11.70 BRAND: AMERICO	\$58.50	\$9.00 BRAND: ACS	\$45.00	\$8.55 BRAND: ACS	\$42.75
96	DUST PANS, METAL	24 EACH	\$3.34 BRAND: CONTINENTAL 715	\$80.16	\$3.95 BRAND: N/A	\$94.80	\$2.64 BRAND: IMPACT	\$63.36	\$4.15 BRAND: IMPACT	\$99.60
97	PADS, SUPER HIGH WHITE POLISH, 20 INCH, 5/CASE	15 CASES	\$11.94 BRAND: AMERICO 403520	\$179.10	\$16.45 BRAND: AMERICO	\$246.75	\$11.53 BRAND: 3M	\$172.95	\$12.25 BRAND: ACS	\$183.75

Bid Opening 8/21/14			Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
98	PADS, BUFFING, SCOTCH BRIRE RED, 20 INCH, 5/CASE	10 CASES	\$11.84 BRAND: AMERICO 404420	\$118.40	\$16.45 BRAND: N/A	\$164.50	\$11.53 BRAND: CAREFREE	\$115.30	\$12.25 BRAND: ACS	\$122.50
99	PADS, WHITE LABEL, 20 INCH, 5/CASE	25 CASES	\$11.84 BRAND: AMERICO 401220	\$296.00	\$16.45 BRAND: N/A	\$411.25	\$11.53 BRAND: CAREFREE	\$288.25	\$12.25 BRAND: ACS	\$306.25
100	PADS, WHITE SUPER POLISH, 16 INCH, 5/CASE	25 CASES	\$8.44 BRAND: AMERICO 401216	\$211.00	\$11.70 BRAND: N/A	\$292.50	\$15.91 BRAND: 3M	\$397.75	\$8.55 BRAND: ACS	\$213.75
101	SQUEEGEE REFILL, RUBBER, 18 INCH	24 EACH	NO BID		\$2.80 BRAND: N/A	\$67.20	\$2.34 BRAND: UNGER	\$56.16	\$2.65 BRAND: ETTORE	\$63.60
102	RAGS, CLEANING, POLO (PRICE/LB)	150 LBS	\$0.74 BRAND: ASB R020-C45	\$111.00	\$0.62 BRAND: 103B	\$93.00	\$45.90 BRAND: BALL (3LBS)	\$137.70	NO BID	
103	RAGS, DIAPER, 50LB CASE	6 CASES	\$92.84 BRAND: ASB R010W80	\$557.04	\$94.20 BRAND: 201B	\$565.20	\$25.00 BRAND: BALL	\$150.00	NO BID	
104	SQUEEGEE W/METAL BRACKET 7 3/4" WITH HANDLE	12 EACH	NO BID		NO BID		\$11.07 BRAND: UNGER	\$132.84	NO BID	
105	SQUEEGEE W/METAL BRACKET 11 3/4", WITH HANDLE	12 EACH	NO BID		\$6.10 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$73.20	\$11.52 BRAND: UNGER	\$138.24	NO BID	
106	SQUEEGEE W/METAL BRACKET 18" WITH HANDLE	12 EACH	NO BID		\$8.05 BRAND: OCEDAR	\$96.60	\$15.40 BRAND: UNGER	\$160.80	NO BID	
107	DIXIE #302 PAPER CUPS, 7 OZ, 2500/CASE	5 CASES	NO BID		\$44.23 BRAND: DART	\$221.15	\$79.00 BRAND: IPC	\$395.00	NO BID	
108	DIXIE #701 PAPER CUPS, 3 OZ, 5000/CASE	20 CASES	NO BID		\$38.52 BRAND: DART (2500 CASE)	\$770.40	\$48.22 BRAND: DIXIE	\$964.40	NO BID	
109	ROLL TOWELS, SCOTT #414 PRE-EMBOSSED	300 CASES	NO BID		\$34.10 BRAND: WITNEY	\$10,230.00	\$19.95 BRAND: CASCADE	\$5,985.00	\$32.95 BRAND: NITTANY PAPER	\$9,885.00

	Bid Opening 8/21/14		Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
110	URINAL SANI-SCREEN	100 EACH	NO BID		\$0.72	\$72.00	\$1.44	\$144.00	\$1.00	\$100.00
					BRAND: N/A		BRAND: FRESH		BRAND: FRESH	
111	CITRUS DEGREASER, JEWELL BRAND OR EQUAL 1 GALLON, 6/CASE	12 CASES	NO BID		\$20.60	\$247.20	\$31.22	\$374.64		
					BRAND: JEWEL (4/CASE)		BRAND: BETCO (1 GAL., 4/CASE)			
112	DELUX-WAX COTE, 1 GALLON, 6/CASE	12 CASES	NO BID		\$52.50	\$626.40	\$36.88	\$442.56	NO BID	
					BRAND: STARCO SUMMIT		BRAND: JOHNSON			
113	DCL SOLUTIONS MFG. "PAK-ITS" TM, WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID PACKETS #C405 LOW-FOAM EXTRACTION CLEANER, 50 PACKETS/CONT., 4 GAL YIELD/PACKET	5 CONT.	NO BID		\$69.20	\$346.00	NO BID		NO BID	
					BRAND: AQUA CHEM (100 PACKETS/CONTAINER)					
114	DCL SOLUTIONS MFG. "PAK-ITS" TM, WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID PACKETS #Q305 GLASS & HARD SURFACE CLEANER, 80 PACKETS/CONT., 1QT YIELD/PACKET	25 BOXES	NO BID		\$61.60	\$1,540.00	NO BID		NO BID	
					BRAND: AQUA CHEM					
115	DCL SOLUTIONS MFG. "PAK-ITS" TM, WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID PACKETS #Q330 CARPET PRE-SPOTTER, 80 PACKETS/CONT., 1/2 QT YIELD/PACKET	5 CONT.	NO BID		\$63.50	\$317.50	NO BID		NO BID	
					BRAND: AQUA CHEM					
116	QUART CONTAINERS WITH SPRAY TRIGGER FOR ABOVE PRODUCTS WITH RIGHT-TO-KNOW INFO ON CONTAINER	25 EACH	NO BID		\$1.60	\$40.00	NO BID		NO BID	
					BRAND: AQUA CHEM					
117	RUBBER GLOVES, SIZE XL, NO LATEX, 1 DOZ/PKG	4 CASES	\$10.64	\$42.56	NO BID		\$9.48	\$37.92	NO BID	
				BRAND: CALICO 293717VLD			BRAND: SAFETY ZONE			
118	GLOVES, EXAM, PVC, 100/BOX, 10 BOX/CASE GLIVEX OR EQUAL	25 CASES	\$27.44	\$686.00	\$22.68	\$567.00	\$33.66	\$841.50	\$21.80	\$545.00
				BRAND: SAFETY ZONE GVE R	BRAND: TRADEX		BRAND: CLARA		BRAND: HYGRADE	
119	HOT DRINK CUPS, 8OZ.	8 CASES	NO BID		\$19.67	\$157.36	\$39.42	\$315.36	\$30.75	\$246.00
					BRAND: N/A		BRAND: N/A		BRAND: N/A	
120	COLD DRINK CUPS, 8 OZ.	8 CASES	NO BID		\$19.67	\$157.36	\$94.93	\$759.44	NO BID	
					BRAND: N/A		BRAND: N/A			

Bid Opening 8/21/14			Calico Industries, Inc.		Camden Bag & Paper Co.		Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC		Office Basics, Inc.	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
121	DISH DETERGENT, 1 QT	8 CASES	NO BID		\$14.75 \$118.00 BRAND: N/A (4/1 GAL)		\$36.06 \$288.48 BRAND: PALMOLIVE		\$21.50 \$172.00 BRAND: N/A	
122	GLASS CLEANER SPRAY, 32 OZ	6 CASES	NO BID		\$21.80 \$130.80 BRAND: BETCO		\$14.31 \$85.86 BRAND: N/A		\$18.65 \$111.90 BRAND: N/A	
123	INSECT SPRAY P-30 CHERRY BLOSSOM, 12OZ CAN 24/CASE	24 CASES	NO BID		\$36.46 \$875.04 18OZ CAN, 12/CASE		\$44.16 \$1,059.84 BRAND: BETCO		NO BID	
124	FAST ORANGE HAND CLEANER PUMP, 1 GALLON	5 CASES	NO BID		\$79.80 \$399.00 BRAND: TRITON		NO BID		\$42.50 \$212.50 BRAND: N/A	
125	PALMITA V HAND SOAP HONEY ALMOND	5 CASES NO SUBS	NO BID		\$99.80 \$499.00 BRAND: TRITON		\$15.51 \$77.55 BRAND: N/A		NO BID	
126	3M BRAND SCRUBBER SPONGES, 20/BOX	2 CASES	NO BID		\$16.89 \$33.76 BRAND: AMERICO		\$13.86 \$27.72 BRAND: 3M		\$14.50 \$29.00 BRAND: PREMIERE	
127	ROLL TOWEL WHITE #6820 NORTH RIVER OR EQUAL	120 CASES	NO BID		\$20.82 \$2,498.40 BRAND: PUTNEY		\$20.23 \$2,427.60 BRAND: CASCADE		\$18.90 \$2,268.00 BRAND: N/A	
128	GEORGIA PACIFIC WHITE ROLL #89460 OR EQUAL 10" X 40"	60 CASES	NO BID		NO BID		\$54.50 \$3,270.00 BRAND: N/A		\$56.75 \$3,405.00 BRAND: N/A	
129	GEORGIA PACIFIC BROWN TOWEL OR EQUAL #89440, 8.25" X 700" SKID OF 55	120 CASES	NO BID		NO BID		\$17.85 \$2,142.00 BRAND: CASCADE		\$60.55 \$7,266.00 BRAND: N/A	
130	WET MOP HEAD (NO LINT) MED. NONWOVEN LOOP	48 EACH	\$4.14 \$198.72 BRAND: ABCO LM 4003MW		\$2.98 \$143.04 BRAND: OCEDAR		\$2.58 \$103.20 BRAND: JANICO		NO BID	
131	LOBBY BROOM AND DUST PAN COMBO	12 EACH	\$9.41 \$112.92 BRAND: CONTINENTAL 912		\$18.30 \$219.60 BRAND: OCEDAR		\$9.07 \$108.84 BRAND: NORSELL		NO BID	

VENDOR		VENDOR	
South Jersey Paper Products 2400 Industrial Way Vineland, NJ 08360 Mr. Michael Tedor 856-691-2605 Phone 856-794-8979 Fax		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc. DBA General Chemical Supply 119 E. Kings Hwy., Suite 103 Maple Shade, NJ 08052 Mr. David McDonough 856-778-5550 Ph / 856-778-7831 Fax	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
\$20.94	\$104.70	\$37.39	\$186.95
BRAND: FASTBALL		BRAND: DRK 91330	
\$9.24	\$369.60	\$9.85	\$394.00
BRAND: KIK PRODUCTS		BRAND: KRK 91330	
\$14.68	\$146.80	\$18.00	\$181.10
BRAND: BAB-O		BRAND: BABO	
\$16.74	\$1,004.40	\$17.28	\$1,036.80
BRAND: PINE CLUR		BRAND: PC 50501	
\$20.47	\$245.64	\$21.71	\$260.52
BRAND: RUBBERMAID - WHITE 7708		BRAND: IMP 7704	
\$21.97	\$439.40	\$31.15	\$623.00
BRAND: PRO SERIES 234		BRAND: MD844	
\$16.68	\$2,502.00	\$17.64	\$2,646.00
BRAND: BOWL BRYTE		BRAND: SANI BLUE RMC 11771415	
\$4.88	\$253.76	\$6.61	\$343.72
BRAND: CS300S		BRAND: O'CEDAR OCED 6122	
\$20.04	\$200.40	\$29.37	\$293.70
BRAND: PRO SERIES 241		BRAND: MD813	
\$25.83	\$516.60	\$22.04	\$440.80
BRAND: FORCE DRAIN		BRAND: OPEN-UP SZ-12-449012	

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
\$4.65	\$55.80	NO BID	
BRAND: S-Z GRFY			
\$4.65	\$55.80	NO BID	
BRAND: S-Z GRFY			
\$2.41	\$421.75	\$1.48	\$259.00
BRAND: O'DELL 5312		BRAND: CAR1013	
\$3.43	\$600.25	\$2.83	\$495.25
BRAND: O'DELL 5324		BRAND: CAR1016	
\$2.80	\$280.00	\$2.01	\$201.00
BRAND: O'DELL 5316		BRAND: CAR1014	
\$3.18	\$159.00	\$2.30	\$115.00
BRAND: O'DELL 2116		BRAND: 1064	
\$48.00	\$144.00	\$52.00	\$156.00
BRAND: IMPACT 200		BRAND: IMP 204	
\$5.79	\$69.48	\$4.71	\$56.52
BRAND: IMPACT 9152		BRAND: CAR 903	
\$38.90	\$466.80	\$45.43	\$545.16
BRAND: IMPACT 742636		BRAND: CAR 941	
NO BID		NO BID	
NO BID		NO BID	
\$15.89	\$635.20	\$17.94	\$717.60
BRAND: CLEAN & SOFT		BRAND: PRO CHOICE PCSP01	

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
NO BID		NO BID	
\$47.52 BRAND: CLAIRE (14OZ, 12/CASE)	\$380.16	\$46.02 BRAND: CLAIRE CLR005	\$368.16
\$2.74 BRAND: CS247	\$65.76	\$4.71 BRAND: CARLISLE CPR3621123	\$113.04
\$46.28 BRAND: MPC FLASH	\$1,851.20	\$43.59 BRAND: SZ-EL 1000005	\$1,743.60
\$72.14 BRAND: ELUMINATE	\$3,607.00	NO BID	
NO BID		NO BID	
\$38.54 BRAND: MAJESTIC (32 OZ./12 CASE)	\$308.32	NO BID	
\$33.26 BRAND: ARM & HAMMER (42 OZ.) 9/CASE	\$665.20	\$31.90 BRAND: FRS 12-14-0080 (12 OZ)	\$638.00
\$54.67 BRAND: DRANO	\$1,093.40	NO BID	
\$129.92 BRAND: 3M (21 OZ)	\$2,598.40	\$158.95 BRAND: 3M	\$3,179.00
\$27.03 BRAND: MPC FLASHBACK	\$270.30	NO BID	
\$86.16 BRAND: NO SUBS	\$1,703.20	\$92.74 BRAND: NO SUBS	\$1,854.80

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
\$23.73	\$237.30	\$59.81	\$598.10
BRAND: PRO SERIES 232		BRAND: DRK 5765571	
\$33.10	\$99.30	\$34.98	\$104.94
BRAND: NOXON (12/CASE)		BRAND: RC00117	
\$29.79	\$297.90	\$24.71	\$247.10
BRAND: MPC DEEP KLEEN (4/CASE)		BRAND: SMS EXTRACTION	
\$138.20	\$5,528.00	NO BID	
BRAND: NO SUBS			
\$138.20	\$5,528.00	NO BID	
BRAND: ENVIROX 117			
NO BID		\$23.07	\$276.84
		BRAND: 1251-2	
\$28.23	\$141.15	\$32.30	\$161.50
BRAND: RMC #4		BRAND: RMC 25130973	
\$57.21	\$286.05	\$80.77	\$403.85
BRAND: RMC NATURELLE		BRAND: RMC36219224035	
\$53.40	\$267.00	\$57.81	\$289.05
BRAND: OFF (12/CASE)		BRAND: DRKCB018425	
\$47.11	\$235.55	\$54.80	\$229.00
BRAND: RAID (15 OZ.)		BRAND: CLR 261	
\$40.19	\$200.95	\$47.24	\$236.20
BRAND: RAID (17.5 OZ, 12/CASE)		BRAND: CLR 296	
NO BID		NO BID	

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
NO BID		NO BID	
NO BID		NO BID	
\$15.05 BRAND: UNISAN 4416	\$301.00	\$17.14 BRAND: N/A	\$342.80
NO BID		NO BID	
\$8.72 BRAND: UNISAN 4516	\$218.00	\$13.89 BRAND: CMP 12	\$347.25
\$16.95 BRAND: CMP-12	\$339.00	\$8.75 BRAND: CMP 12	\$175.00
\$40.32 BRAND: IMPACT	\$80.64	\$73.80 BRAND: RUBBERMAID	\$147.60
\$9.88 BRAND: CS180-24	\$118.56	\$9.45 BRAND: CARLISLE 3621912403	\$113.40
\$9.76 BRAND: CS139-24	\$117.12	\$11.52 BRAND: CAR3621922403	\$138.24
\$1.69 BRAND: CSS92	\$40.56	NO BID	
\$56.60 BRAND: RMC 25132	\$113.20	\$63.50 BRAND: IMP 1120	\$127.00
\$38.22 BRAND: CONTICO 4444	\$458.64	\$23.90 BRAND: IMP-7744-3	\$286.80

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
\$18.94	\$56.82	\$2.60	\$7.80
BRAND: EUR 60295-6 (18 CASE)		BRAND: 862	
\$82.78	\$1,241.70	\$83.98	\$1,259.70
BRAND: PALMER 235		BRAND: SANJAMAR	
\$0.72	\$72.00	\$0.51	\$51.00
BRAND: EUR 30563		BRAND: 30563A	
NO BID		\$1.02	\$25.50
		BRAND: N/A	
\$2.34	\$175.50	\$2.07	\$155.25
BRAND: ACS 1060		BRAND: CAR 7270	
\$8.96	\$107.52	\$8.20	\$98.40
BRAND: CS186		BRAND: CARLISLE 3621941600	
\$2.14	\$214.00	\$2.11	\$211.00
BRAND: CS625		BRAND: RM-6310	
NO BID		NO BID	
NO BID		\$12.92	\$387.60
		BRAND: #348	
\$5.56	\$27.80	\$8.33	\$41.65
BRAND: ACS 618		BRAND: IMP-2000	
NO BID		NO BID	
NO BID		NO BID	

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
NO BID		\$33.45 \$200.70 BRAND: PFTD0220-01	
\$39.34 \$1,967.00 BRAND: SWIFFER 40509		\$38.16 \$1,908.00 BRAND: PGC40509	
\$5.28 \$190.08 BRAND: TOLCO 280126		\$11.68 \$420.48 BRAND: IMP-3120	
\$79.00 \$948.00 BRAND: ENV-252		NO BID	
\$182.45 \$364.90 BRAND: J-6		NO BID	
NO BID		NO BID	
\$46.59 \$279.54 BRAND: RUBBERMAID		\$21.15 \$126.90 BRAND: RMC25125200	
\$27.54 \$330.48 BRAND: RUBBERMAID		\$18.86 \$226.32 BRAND: RMC25121298	
\$27.88 \$1,394.00 BRAND: RMC 50RA		\$24.80 \$1,240.00 BRAND: GENTSC	
\$5.62 \$134.88 BRAND: CS436		\$3.53 \$84.72 BRAND: CAR9124	
\$37.19 \$446.28 BRAND: ANDERSEN		\$72.89 \$874.68 BRAND: N/A	
\$58.46 \$701.52 BRAND: ANDERSEN		\$107.21 \$1,286.52 BRAND: N/A	

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
\$7.38 BRAND: CS940-24	\$73.80	\$7.97 BRAND:	\$79.70
\$5.27 BRAND:	\$263.50	\$5.24 BRAND: CAR7130	\$262.00
\$5.56 BRAND: CS400-36	\$400.32	\$4.71 BRAND: CAR9064	\$339.12
\$4.12 BRAND: CS400-24	\$296.64	\$3.25 BRAND: CAR9063	\$234.00
NO BID		NO BID	
\$3.28 BRAND: CS400-18	\$118.08	\$2.54 BRAND: CAR9062	\$91.44
\$5.74 BRAND: CS910-18	\$68.88	\$7.67 CAR7250-9122	\$92.04
NO BID		NO BID	
\$7.90 BRAND: ACS 51-16	\$79.00	\$8.57 BRAND: PAD 4016RED	\$85.70
\$7.90 BRAND: ACS 72-16	\$39.50	\$8.57 BRAND: PAD4016BLA	\$42.85
\$3.59 BRAND: IMPACT 4212	\$86.16	\$4.09 BRAND: IMP 4212	\$98.16
\$11.20 BRAND: ACS 41-20	\$168.00	\$12.20 BRAND: PAD4020WHI	\$183.00

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
\$11.20 BRAND: ACS 51.20	\$112.00	\$12.20 BRAND: PAD4020 RED	\$122.00
\$11.20 BRAND: ACS 41-20	\$280.00	\$12.20 BRAND: PAD4020 WHI	\$305.00
\$7.90 BRAND: ACS 41-16	\$197.50	\$8.57 BRAND: PAD4016 WHI	\$214.25
\$2.18 BRAND: UNGER RT45	\$52.32	\$2.19 BRAND: ETT 1427	\$52.26
NO BID		\$0.85 BRAND: N/A	\$127.50
NO BID		NO BID	
NO BID		NO BID	
\$11.66 BRAND: UNGER PR30	\$139.92	NO BID	
\$12.84 BRAND: UNGER PR45 - 2000	\$154.08	NO BID	
\$98.56 BRAND: SWEETHEART (2000/CASE)	\$492.80	NO BID	
\$78.30 BRAND: SWEETHEART (2400/CASE)	\$1,566.00	NO BID	
\$15.44 BRAND: METRO 4200 FT. / CASE	\$4,632.00	NO BID	

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
\$1.14	\$114.00	\$0.74	\$74.00
BRAND: FRESH PRODUCTS		BRAND: FRS12-SANI-GA	
\$32.38	\$388.56	NO BID	
BRAND: RIDGEWAY (4/CASE)			
\$44.32	\$531.84	NO BID	
BRAND: CLASSIC COTE (4/CASE)			
NO BID		NO BID	
NO BID		NO BID	
NO BID		NO BID	
MP BOD		NO BID	
\$4.88	\$19.52	NO BID	
BRAND: S-Z GRFY			
\$21.80	\$545.00	NO BID	
BRAND: S-Z GVDR			
\$45.78	\$366.24	\$32.56	\$260.48
BRAND: N/A		BRAND: GENHC8	
\$98.62	\$788.96	NO BID	
BRAND: N/A			

South Jersey Paper Products		Dave's Cleaning Service, Inc.	
UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
\$21.84 BRAND: N/A	\$174.72	\$48.77 BRAND: STA8391	\$390.16
\$21.29 BRAND: N/A	\$127.74	\$17.52 BRAND: PC50632	\$105.12
NO BID		NO BID	
\$56.16 BRAND: DEB SB5 (4/1 GAL)	\$280.80	\$43.40 BRAND: N/A	\$217.00
NO BID		NO BID	
\$36.64 BRAND: 3M	\$73.28	\$41.09 BRAND: 3M	\$82.18
\$18.74 BRAND: METRO	\$2,248.80	\$20.87 BRAND: PSC6820	\$2,504.40
\$47.54 BRAND: N/A	\$2,852.40	NO JBID	
\$42.36 BRAND: N/A	\$5,083.20	NO BID	
\$3.58 BRAND: O'DELL BW308	\$171.84	\$2.33 BRAND: CAR 1024-LE	\$111.84
\$9.20 BRAND: IMPACT	\$110.40	\$10.61 BRAND: CAR7460	\$127.32