
7/2/2021

VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:

CarEffex, LLC
General Sales Administration, Inc.

t/a Major Police Supply Mall Chevrolet, Inc.

587 Mantua Blvd 47 N. Dell Avenue 75 Haddonfield Road

Sewell, NJ 08080 Kenvil, NJ 07847 Cherry Hill, NJ 08002

Michael Layton, Owner J. Bradley Badal, President Richard DiRenzo, Fleet Mgr.

856-468-3800 973-584-7714 856-662-7000 x183

856-468-3805 - Fax 973-584-5022 - Fax 856-504-0108 - Fax

ITEM DESCRIPTION                

001 SPECIALTY FABRICATION

LABOR COST $100.00/M/H NO BID $165.00/MH
MATERIAL DISCOUNT 5% NO BID 10%

002 WRAP VINYL LETTERING

TAILGATE SAFETY STRIPING PICK UP TYPICAL

    F-250 $350.00/UNIT NO BID $450.00/UNIT
    F-450 (DUMP BODY) $395.00/UNIT NO BID $450.00/UNIT

003 AMBULANCE (COMPLETE)

   E-450/STANDARD AMBULANCE BOX - COUNTY STANDARD 
LETTERING, SEAL & STRIPING $750.00/UNIT NO BID $3,500.00/UNIT

004 DTS BUSSES (COMPLETE)

   TYPICAL 16 PASS. BUS - COUNTY STANDARD LETTERING, SEAL     & 
STRIPING $1,000.00/UNIT NO BID $3,500.00/UNIT
    

005 CORRECTIONS & SHERIFF

EXPLORER TYPICAL (STANDARD POLICE) COUNTY STANDARD
LETTERING, SEAL & STRIPING $650.00/UNIT NO BID $950.00/UNIT

006 EMS SUPERVISOR VEHICLES

TAHOE TYPICAL COUNTY STANDARD LETTERING, SEAL & STRIPING
$650.00/UNIT NO BID $950.00/UNIT

PD 021-025

Bid Opening 06/11/21 at 10:00 a.m.

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE FABRICATION AND DELIVERY OF CUSTOM

AUTOMOTIVE ACCESSORIES FOR THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

AND EXISTING UNITS WITHIN THE COUNTY AS ALLOWED THROUGH THE

COUNTY CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM NUMBERS CK-01-GC & 16GLCP



7/2/2021

007 MISC. VINYL LETTERING $150.00/MH NO BID $950.00/MH
MATERIAL DISCOUNT 5% NO BID 10%

008 MISC. EQUIPMENT PAINTING

LABOR COST $100.00/MH NO BID $85.00/MH
MATERIAL DISCOUNT 5% NO BID 10%

009 INSTALLATION OF LIGHTS

LABOR COST $100.00/MH $93.00/MH $69.00/MH

MATERIAL DISCOUNT

5%

Federal Signal: 47%; Troy
Products: 30%; Jotto Desk: 15%;
Havis Shield: 35%; Feniex Lights:

35% Pro-gard: 20%; American
Aluminum: 11%; Setina: 18% 10%

010 INSTALLATION OF RADIOS

RADIOS SUPPLIED BY COUNTY

LABOR COST $100.00/MH $93.00/MH $69.00/MH
MATERIAL DISCOUNT 5% 5% 10%

Variations NONE NONE NONE

Will you Extend your Prices to local government entities within the County.
NO YES YES

The Term of this Contract shall be for a two year period with the County having
the option to extend the contract for two (2) one (1) year terms or one (1) two (2)
year terms.

Bid Specifications sent to: Prime Vendor

Municipal Equipment Enterprise

Sincerely

Kimberly A. Larter, Qualified Purchasing Agent

Based upon the bids received, I recommend CarEffex for items #001, 002, 003, 004, 005, 006, 007; Mall Chevrolet for items 008, 009 and 010 as
the lowest, responsible responsive bidders per item.
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