PD-021-035

Bid Opening 8/26/2021 10:00am

DELIVERY OF GRASS SEED, TOPDRESSING,

FERTILIZERS, & PLANT PROTECTANTS FOR

THE COUNTY GOLF COURSE AND VETERANS

CEMETERY VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Seeton Turf Warehouse, Helena Agri Enterprises, Grass Roots Turf
Fisher & Son Company |LLC dba Noble Turf SiteOne Landsc. Supply |LLC Synatek Prod., Inc.
737 Hagey Center Dr., 4 Middlebury
110 Summit Dr. 25 Roland Ave. 1385 East 36th St. 500 Pedricktown Road Unit A Blvd/Suite7

Exton, PA 19341

Mount Laurel, NJ 08054

Cleveland, Oh 44114

Swedesboro, NJ 08085

Souderton, PA 18964

Randolph, NJ 07869

Zachary Owen

Landon T. Seeton

Keith McGinty, Director

Nick Adams, Branch Mgr.

Rachel Murphy,
CustomerCare

Keith Kubik, Pres.

800 262-2127

856 273-5939

216-706-9250 ext 2

856 241-2070

888 408-5433

973-252-6634

610 363-0563 Fax

856 273-0998 Fax

248 581-1433 Fax

973-252-6630 Fax

bids@fisherandson.com

finance@nobleturf.com

bids@siteOne.com

adamsn@helenaagri.com

mgrubman@synateksolutions.com

Keith.Kubik@griturf.com

Section |

Description

uan.

c
2.
=

Grass seed Perennial Ryegrass, Tri Rye

8000

3.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Seed must be USDA Blue Tag Certified

50 Lb. bag

Gray Leaf spot resistant

Grass seed Kentucky Bluegrass, "Midnight"

800

5.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Seed must be USDA Blue Tag Certified

Midnight type Bluegrass; 50Lb. Bags,

Grass seed, Bentgrass, Declaration, Focus,

50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

9.65

Luminary, or Barracuda preferred. Dollar Spot

declaration

Resistance. Seed must be USDA Blue Tag

Certified - 25lb pails

Topdressing. 90% sand, 10% Canadian humus

100

ton

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Sterilized dry, pH greater than 5.8. Bulk shipments

shipments delivered throughout the season

Bunker sand, GC-300 sub-angular sand with

100

ton

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

minimal silt and clay. Must drain at 12”/hour.

Bulk shipments delivered throughout the season.
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Section I

Iltem #|Description

1 ]22-0-22 Blended fertilizer, 50% XCU urea 8 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bulk shipments throughout the season (with

2 |22-0-22 Blended fertilizer, 30% XCU urea 3 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bulk shipments throughout the season (with

3 |21-3-16 greens grade fertilizer with 63% BCMU 40| bag NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Slow release Nitrogen 50 Ib. bag

4 |0-0-50 potassium sulfate, greens grade 50 Ib. bag| % | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID 26.00 NO BID NO BID

5 |]10-0-20 Blended fertilizer, 30% XCU urea 12| ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bulk shipments throughout the season (with

6 |20-0-10 Blended fertilizer, 50% XCU urea 5 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bulk shipments throughout the season, 50 # bags

7 |20-0-20 Blended fertilizer, 50% sulfur coated urea 2 fon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bulk shipments throughout the season, 50# bags

8 |0-0-26 "Starphite" phosphite liquid fertilizer, il NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00 NO BID NO BID

9 |High Calium Lime, in bulk, with application 78 | Ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 |Calcium Sulphate, Gypsum 2000 | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.16 NO BID NO BID
MicroTek water soluble micronutrients package for NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.00/LB 400.00 NO BID

11 Jturf 50 Ib
Liquid Fertilizer, 10-34-0 Ammonium NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

12 |Polyphosphate 60 | cal
Section Il

ltem #|Description

1 |Daconil Weatherstik Fungicide, Syngenta 10 | ca 83.46 NO BID 65.90 65.90 64.00 65.90
chlorothalonil

2 |Chlorothalonil, flowable, 54% active ingredient 30 | ca NO BID NO BID 35.88 42.00 NO BID NO BID




LESCO MANICURE

6FL 2.5 GAL
3 JAzoxystrobin, 50WG 50% Active Ingredient 40 b NO BID 689.00 332.70 148.00 NO BID 332.70/POUND
2F NOT 50WG - GAL | HERITAGE 6 LB

4 |Dyloz 420 SL, 37.3% Tichlorfon 0 | ca NO BID 89.69 69.00 NO BID 80.00/GALLON
5 |Tebuconazole, 38.7% active ingrediant 6 | ca NO BID NO BID 64.06 48.00 NO BID 145.00/GALLON
6 |Propiconazole, 14.3% active ingredient 6 | ca NO BID NO BID 64.64 48.00 NO BID 65.00/GALLON

LESCO

SPECTATOR ULTRA

1 GAL

7 |Bifenthrin, 25% Active Ingredient 25 | cal NO BID NO BID 618.84 44.00 (7.9%) NO BID 56.00/1 GALLON
JUG
ONYX PRO 32 OZ
8 [Metalaxyl, 25.1% active ingredient 4 Gal NO BID NO BID NO BID 340.00 NO BID 554.15/GALLON
9 |lprodione, 23.3% Active ingredient 40 | cal NO BID NO BID 61.22 54.00 NO BID 57.00/GALLON
LESCO 18 PLUS 2.5
GAL
10 [Xzemplar, Fluxapyroxad, 26.55% active ingredient| > | & 1488.84 1671.48 1488.84 1488.84 NO BID 1488.84
114 oz. 114 oz. 114 oz
11 |Thiophanate-methyl, 46.2% active ingredient 60 | ca 66.00 NO BID 41.00 36.00 NO BID 54.00/GALLON
LESCO T-STORM

2.5 GAL

12 |Nonionic Surfactant,Minimum 80% surfactant 20 | cal 60.00 NO BID 15.82 13.00 NO BID NO BID
LESCO 2.5 GAL
13 |Acelepryn, Chlorantraniliprole, 18.4% [N e 1072.75 NO BID 2145.50 1072.75 2,063.00/GAL 2145.50/GALLON
1/2 Gallon

14 |Confront Herbicide, Triclopyr 33%, Clopyralid s | ca NO BID NO BID 139.66 140.00 NO BID 133.00/GALLON
15 |Pylex Herbicide, Topramezone, 29.7% 128 | oz 68.00 68.00 68.00 68.00 NO BID 68.00/OUNCE




16 |Andersons Goosegrass/Crabgrass Control 576 | Ibs NO BID 4.37 4,22 3.28 NO BID 125.90/28.8 LB
BAG
SGN 80 5.25% Bensulide and 1.31% Oxidiazon
stock number AGC8656-1, 28.8lb bags
17 |Ference Insecticide 288 | oz 18.85 NO BID 18.85 18.85 18.30 18.85/OUNCE
18 [Merit 2F, Imidacloprid, 21.4% Active Ingredient 25 | ca NO BID NO BID 58.94 55.00 NO BID 57.00/1 GALLON
JUG
LESCO BANDIT 2F 1
GAL
19 |Emerald 70WG case=10x1 bag (bag=.49%) 4 | Case 1063.30 1063.30 1063.30 1063.30 NO BID 1063.30/CASE
20 |Nassau 4SC Herbicide ! Gal NO BID NO BID NO BID 350.00 NO BID 544.00/0.5 GAL
JUG
ANTARES
21 |Insignia Intrinsic, Pyraclostrobin, 23.3% 7 cal 1244.00 1244.00 1244.00 1244.00 NO BID 1244.00/GALLON
2.5 GALLON JUG
22 |Prostar 70 WDG case: 4x3# 36 | b NO BID NO BID 72.39 62.00 NO BID 300.00/GALLON
23 |Provaunt Insecticide, Indoxacarb, 30% 360 | oz 5.50 NO BID 5.50 5.50 5.30 5.50/0UNCE
24 |Propamaacarp Hydrochloride, 66.5% Active ing. 4 | ca NO BID NO BID 370.14 255.00 NO BID 999.20/2.5 GAL
JUG
PROPLANT 1 GAL
25 |Ronstar G Herbicide, oxadiazon 2%, 50Ib Bag 8000 | Ibs NO BID NO BID 1.79 1.32 NO BID 36.00/50 LB BAG
OXADIAZON 26 50
LB
26 |Velista, 50% Penthiopyrad 770 ] oz 10.30 NO BID 10.30 10.30 10.00 10.30/OUNCE
27 |Dispatch Srayable, 30% Alkoxylated polyols 30 | ca NO BID NO BID 29.75 48.00 NO BID 91.40/gallon
21% Glucoethera LESCO WETPLUS FIRM UP Note: 30 Gallon
NONIONIC Drum
WETTING AGENT 30
28 |Bayleton 50%, Triadimefon active ingredient i 554 per gallon NO BID NO BID 399.68 per Gallon NO BID 554.00/gallon




29 35 b 198.00 per Ib NO BID 792.00/64 OZ 198.00 NO BID 198.00/LB (NOTE
Match point, 36% Spinosad 4L.B JUG)
30 |Legacy Plant Growth Regulator 25 | ca 397.62 NO BID 397.62 397.62 397.80 397.62/GALLON
31 |Defoamer, Foam buster, 20% 5 | ca NO BID NO BID 29.52 38.00 NO BID 36.00/GALLON
BRANDT
DEFOAMER 32 OZ
32 |Mancozeb DG fungicide, 75% active ingredient 44 | b NO BID NO BID 5.00 5.25 NO BID 8.75/POUND
33 [Methylated Seed QOil 20 | ca NO BID NO BID 20.25 18.00 NO BID 20.00/GALLON
34 |Dimension 2EW, dithiopyr, 24% 5 cal 215.50 NO BID 215.50 215.50 215.50 215.50/GALLON
35 |Shaw's 17-0-5, 30%XRTw/ Acelepryn and 4000 | 1o NO BID NO BID 1.45 NO BID 1.27 60.00/50 LB BAG
Dimension
(1328909)
36 |Glyphosate, 41% active ingredient 5 | ca NO BID NO BID 18.67 18.00 NO BID 23.00/GALLON
LESCO
PROSECUTOR PRO
2.5 GAL
37 |Super signal Blue, Precision Labs 5 | ca NO BID NO BID 20.94 NO BID NO BID 53.00/GALLON
LESCO TRACKER
SPRAY INDICATR
DYE BLUE 2.5 GAL
38 |Mec-amine D,Broadleaf herbicide 25 | ca NO BID NO BID 24.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID

LESCO THREE WAY|
SELECTIVE 2.5 GAL




VARIATIONS

SEE ABOVE

#8
STARPHITE-ELEMAX
FOLIAR PHSPHITE
0026;
#11-MICROTEK-AXIL
OMIXS5;
#20-NASSAU-ANTAR
ES; #27
DISPATCH-FIRMUP
1.5 0zZ/M

Item 3-Syngenta's
Heritage WDG;
5-Nufarm's Torque;
6-syngenta's
Dorado (2 gal/jug);
7-FMC's Talstar
Select (1gal/jug)’
8-Syngenta's
Subdue MAXX;
9-Bayer's Chipco
26019 Flo'
11-PROKo0Z's
Transom 4.5F;
20-FMC's Dismiss
(0.5 gall/jug);
22-PBl's Pedigree
SC (2.5 gal/jug);
23-Syngenta's
provaunt WDG (72
0z/jug)-20%
Indoxacarb;
24-Bayer's Banol
(2.5 galljug);
25-Lebanon's CC
0-0-7 +1% Ronstar
(501b bag);
28-Bayer's
Bayleton Flo (2.5
gal/jug; 31-Brandt's
Defoamer (1
gt/bottle);
32-Corteva's
FORE 80WP;
33-Brandt's MSO

This Contract is for a two year period with

extend for one two vear period or two one vear

Will you extend your prices to local

YES

YES

YES

YES

NO

YES

entities within the County

Bid specifications sent to:




Based upon all bids received | recommend contracts be awarded to the following vendors as the lowest responsive, responsible bidders as follows:




	Bids



